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FINDING YOUR WAY TO  
HORIZON EQUINE VETERINARY CLINIC 
 

Horizon Equine Veterinary Clinic is situated on the 
WestGen campus at 1625 Angus Campbell Road in 
Abbotsford.  The campus is south of Hwy 1 and east of 
Hwy 11. 

Upon entry to the campus through the front gate, veer 
left along the roadway, which leads to the ARC Barn.  
Parking for trucks and trailers is available at the edge of 
the parking area, adjacent to the round pen. Should 
there be any need to turn your truck and trailer around, 
drive past the round pen to the back of the barn, where 
ample space allows for a convenient U-turn. 

Before unloading any horse, walk along the extended 
pathway leading to the southwest corner of the main 
office building. Here, a single glass door leads to the 
Horizon Equine Welcome Centre, where our Care 
Coordinators are ready to assist with registration and 
any paperwork. 

 

Ensuring comfort & safety  
Safety Precautions 
Prioritizing your safety, we recommend wearing 
appropriate footwear when either dropping off or 
unloading your horse from the trailer. It’s essential that 
your horse is equipped with a halter and lead rope 
before unloading. Our skilled equine veterinary 
assistants are on hand to ensure the safe unloading of 
your horse. 
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